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Story #1 
 
The Fidelity Bank downtown was rocked by 
an armed robbery this morning.  
 
 
Two men brandishing shotguns entered the 
bank, forcing everyone to get on the ground 
except for bank manager Jack Sherry 
 
In total, the two men stole twenty-two 
thousand dollars. “Fortunately, we hadn’t 
taken all of the money we would have left 
out of the vault; they seemed interested in 
the money they could see.” 
 
The assailants are still on the run. Officers 
say that they drove away in a red, four-door 
chevrolet with New York license plates  
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Story #2  
The Local Machinists Union 333 has called 
for an indefinite walk-out strike of all 
employees at the General Motors plant. 
 
Following failure to renew a contract 
between both parties. 
 
 
 Leaders in the union say that the company's 
inaction cannot continue. “We have 
bargained in good faith, but we see no 
evidence that General Motors is doing the 
same thing.”  
 
 
 
 



MCU of the reporter with the plant visible 
over the right shoulder. 
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A graphic of how much the school budget 
would increase due to the tax  increase. ​
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General Motors declined our request for a 
statement on the walkout but insisted that 
the plant would remain operational.                             
 
 
 
Story #3  
 
Tensions arose after a new property tax bill 
was passed by the city council. The mayor's 
office reports hundreds of calls, all angry 
over the tax increase.  
 
 
Some residents are not happy about the 10% 
property tax increase. But, the mayor’s 
office anticipated the public's upset.  
 
 
Despite this, the city government insists that 
the tax increase will bring much needed 
relief to the local city school systems. 
 
 
Story #4 
Democratic state representative Milton 
Bradford will not be seeking reelection.  
 
 
The Democrat from Loganville served in the 
State House of Representatives for twenty 
seven years and was speaker for the past ten 
years.  
 
 
Bradford is a strong supporter of the states 
education lobby, recently, he worked to 
secure a pay raise for the states public 
school teachers 
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B-roll of planes taking off from the airport 
tarmac.  
 
 
Graphic displaying how many flights take 
off/ arrive to the Airport  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Story #5  
 
A local record has been set in the county 
after United Way was able to raise more 
money than they ever had before.  
 
  
Over four hundred fifty five thousand 
dollars have been raised to support 
community charities and local service 
organizations  
 
The county’s United Way chairman this year 
Sara Morris was surprised at how much they 
could raise “We couldn't be happier with the 
progress that we have made.”  
 
 
Story #6 
 
A new runway has been announced for the 
airport. The airport authority announced that 
the 3 million dollar extension will be 
complete next year.  
 
 
This runway will accommodate increased 
demand by airlines for more scheduled 
flights.  
 
Airport Authority chairman Sam Peck states 
that the airport will recover quickly from the 
costs.  
 
 
 
 
 

 ​ ​ ​  


