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Adam Burke 

Nobody walks in LA? Think again. 

Can you really consider going car-free in the City of Angels? Its ambitious environmental 

goals would suggest so. 

 

 
Adam Burke is president and chief executive officer of the non-profit Los 
Angeles Tourism & Convention Board. 
 
 

 

Picture Los Angeles. What do you see? Swaying palm trees? Sunny beaches? A red 
carpet? The Hollywood sign, perhaps? Maybe it is miles of motorways with cars at a 
standstill like the opening scene of La La Land. Only without the big musical number and 
dazzling dance moves, probably. 

 

Abbot Kinney, LA. (Photo courtesy of Los Angeles Tourism Board ) 

https://citymonitor.ai/environment
https://citymonitor.ai/author/adamburke1
https://citymonitor.ai/housing/la-mayor-karen-bass-housing-homelessness-project
https://citymonitor.ai/transport/expo-line-and-five-other-reasons-los-angeles-may-finally-shed-its-car-centric-reputation
https://citymonitor.ai/sustainability/los-angeles-walking
https://citymonitor.ai/author/adamburke1
David Brady
This is an op-ed I ghostwrote
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For decades, the cliché of Los Angeles as a city burdened by cars, traffic and smog was a 
go-to for comedians in search of easy laughs. Today, Los Angeles is leading the way to a 
cleaner, greener future with some of the nation’s most ambitious environmental goals, 
chief among them an on-track pledge to achieve carbon-neutral status by 2050. 

But Los Angeles is the city that created the Batmobile, Greased Lightning and the Fast & 
Furious franchise. The move won’t be easy.  

Consider these observations from the city’s 2020 Tourism Master Plan, which outlines 
several priorities ahead of 2028, when Los Angeles will once again host the Summer 
Olympic and Paralympic Games: 

“Although Los Angeles is planning significant investments to deliver a vastly improved 
mass-transit system [by 2028], it will still be difficult to move visitors from their cars to 
other forms of transportation, given the geographic spread of the city; distance between 
hotels, tourism and entertainment clusters, parks, beaches and recreational activities 
and sports venues; and the nature of Los Angeles as a destination. 

“Perhaps even tougher is the need to change the mindset and behaviour of visitors who 
think of Los Angeles as the auto capital of the US, second only to Detroit.” 

Changing minds 

If zero-carbon is the goal in a city so closely identified with cars, how do we get there from 
here? And what responsibility does the tourism industry have in promoting visits that 
balance economic impact with sustainability? 

Los Angeles welcomed a record 50.7 million visitors in 2019. And those guests visit 
attractions throughout the greater LA area every day, which represents a unique 
opportunity to help the city achieve a more energy-efficient future. 

LA’s Green New Deal 

Introduced by Mayor Eric Garcetti in 2019, LA’s Green New Deal is the comprehensive 
blueprint guiding the city’s transition to an economy powered entirely by renewable 
energy.  

https://tourism.lacity.org/city-los-angeles-tourism-master-plan
https://citymonitor.ai/infrastructure/will-anyone-want-to-host-the-next-olympics
https://citymonitor.ai/infrastructure/will-anyone-want-to-host-the-next-olympics
https://www.discoverlosangeles.com/media/facts-about-la
https://plan.lamayor.org/
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An ambitious update of Los Angeles’s 2015 sustainability plan, the Green New Deal will 
spend $8bn on electrical grid upgrades, $860m annually to expand the transportation 
network and billions more to construct clean buildings. 

The plan’s accelerated targets include: 

• reduce vehicle miles travelled per capita by at least 13% by 2025, 39% by 2035 and 45% 
by 2050 
• increase the percentage of zero-emission vehicles in the city to 25% by 2025; 80% by 
2035; and 100% by 2050 
• convert all city fleet vehicles to zero-emission where feasible by 2028  

It’s an audacious roadmap that establishes Los Angeles as a nexus of investment, 
innovation and job creation in the fast-growing green transportation and clean building 
sectors. 

Getting ready for the Games 

In 2018 there were approximately 7.9 million vehicles registered in Los Angeles County. 
By 2028, during the Summer Olympics, an estimated 9.5 million registered vehicles will 
be on the road — a 20% increase over a decade. 

To prepare, forward-looking transportation planners are at work on a “Twenty-Eight by 
’28” plan to prioritise 28 critical road and transit infrastructure projects before the 
Olympic torch arrives in town. 

While most improvements will be used by those who live and work in Los Angeles, more 
than 500,000 visitors and 10,000 athletes, coaches and officials are expected to travel 
throughout the city during the two-week Games. 

“Twenty-Eight by ’28 will help us frame the progress we’re striving to make in the years 
leading up to the Games,” Mayor Garcetti said in announcing the project. “This initiative 
is our opportunity to harness the unifying power of the Olympic movement to transform 
our transportation future.” 

Electric avenue 

In many ways, the future of transportation is already here. California leads the nation in 
the number of electric vehicles (EVs), with 563,070 light-duty electric 
vehicle registrations in 2021, according to the US Department of Energy. Florida ranks a 
distant second with 95,640. 

https://citymonitor.ai/government/los-angeles-measure-j-prison-alternatives-budget
https://citymonitor.ai/transport/e-mobility/electric-vehicles-city-driving-charging-stations
https://afdc.energy.gov/data/10962
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As of June 2022, California had approximately 39% of all EVs in the US and its highest EV 
ownership rate – nearly 12 per 1,000 residents. 

The state made worldwide headlines recently when it announced a ban on the sale of new 
petrol-powered vehicles beginning in 2035. The rule requires automakers to increase 
production of cleaner vehicles beginning in 2026 until only sales of zero-emission cars, 
pickup trucks and SUVs are allowed in California. 

The bold move is expected to spur other states to adopt similar restrictions. At least 15 
states, including New Jersey, New York and Pennsylvania, have adopted California 
vehicle standards on earlier fuel efficiency rules. 

Walking in LA 

But how do you get people out of their cars? 

Los Angeles’s Tourism Master Plan, which was created by the city’s municipal tourism 
department and developed in consultation with hundreds of industry stakeholders, 
acknowledges that getting visitors efficiently to their destinations will be a key challenge 
in the years ahead: 

“The sprawling nature of Los Angeles, along with the car-centric approach to 
transportation in the city and surrounding areas, creates a difficult issue for visitor 
mobility. Just as the city is working to radically change the perception of its residents in 
regard to transportation, so too must Los Angeles focus on changing the perception of 
visitors who feel it necessary to rely on automobiles to explore the destination. 

“In the short term, visitors need to be better educated on how to move about the city, and 
in the long term, visitor mobility must be a principal element in any and all 
transportation infrastructure and destination development activities.” 

At Los Angeles Tourism, we recognise that we play a critical role in changing those 
perceptions. We want to highlight Southern California as home to one of the country’s 
best public transportation networks, with information about the subways, light rail, buses 
and shuttles that visit virtually every corner of the Greater Los Angeles metro area. 

Elsewhere, Car Free LA features a series of self-guided holiday itineraries that each offer 
a unique way to experience Los Angeles’s diverse neighbourhoods via foot, bike or Metro 
train. 

https://www.theguardian.com/us-news/2022/aug/24/california-ban-sales-gas-powered-cars-2035
https://citymonitor.ai/government/camden-new-jersey-isnt-really-a-model-for-police-reform
https://citymonitor.ai/community/public-health/america-safe-drug-consumption-sites
https://www.discoverlosangeles.com/travel/car-free-la


 5 

With more than 431 miles of city bike paths, including 120 new miles created within the 
past few years, along with expanded Metro transit options, it’s easier than ever to 
experience Los Angeles without a car. 

“Nobody walks in LA” Missing Persons once sang. The song’s a classic; the lyric is a myth. 

 

# # # 
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