
A decade of cutting-edge digital innovation has conditioned consumers to expect 

nearly-instantaneous, frictionless interaction when conducting business online. Unfortunately - 

when it comes to bill pay technology - too many financial institutions continue to cling to 

outdated, legacy tech that fails to meet consumer needs.



Simply upgrading or adding new, parallel bill payment capabilities to existing 


ones will fail to deliver the full potential of your digital infrastructure. 



It’s time to migrate legacy bill payment systems to a new platform that offers


the speed, greater convenience and richer functionality that customers expect.


Innovating at 

the Speed of 

the Customer.
It’s time for a broader,

bolder vision.



BillGO enables anyone to accept and make bill payments, This is why major financial 
institutions and fintechs are choosing BillGO.

Discover the power of speed, choice and intelligence.

Learn More

Speed, Choice, 
Intelligence

A Smart Way to 
Generate ROI

Quick & Simple  
Integration

BillGO manages the largest and most 
robust eBill network in the industry, 
enabling your customers to quickly find 
billers, make real-time payments and 
get confirmations instantaneously. 
Designed around a modern user 
experience, they get one simple view to 
manage all their bills and set reminders 
and notifications.

Because bill pay is one of the 
“stickiest” services you can offer, 
BillGO helps you create a 
foundation to build meaningful, 
long-term customer relationships. 
Understanding bill pay patterns 
enables you to customize other 
products and services.  

Our secure, fully-compliant platform 
and state-of-the-art APIs and widgets 
make institutional integration a snap 
enabling interactions between 
enterprise software components, 
operating systems, and microservices. 
And the resulting data fuels 
actionable insights.

The New Way 

to Bill Pay ™

From managing bills & 

subscriptions to making payments, 

the future of bill pay is here.

About BillGO


Doesn’t everyone deserve access to a better financial future? We think so. Our award-winning bill management 

& payment platform enables everyone to fully manage their day-to-day bills and subscriptions all in one place 

while offering a more efficient way to send and receive payments. By combining the power of speed, choice, 

and intelligence, BillGO empowers consumers and the banks, billers and fintechs that serve them.

To learn more contact us: or visit our website:billpay@billgo.com billgo.com
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