
The Best Bento Boxes for Kids That Will 
Make Mealtimes a Breeze 

Packed lunches don't have to be boring! 
 
Bento boxes are the perfect way to pack a variety of different foods into one container. This 
makes mealtimes a breeze and ensures that your child is getting a healthy and balanced meal. 
 
Not only are bento boxes convenient, but they are also healthy and delicious. You can pack a 
variety of nutritious foods into your child's lunchbox, including fruits, vegetables, protein, and 
whole grains. 
 
Click this link to learn more about the best bento boxes for kids! 

How We Choose The Best Bento Box For Kids 

It can be hard to find the best bento style lunch boxes for kids. There are so many different 
options available, and it can be tough to know which one is right for your child's lunch bag. 
 
With all of the different options available, it's tough to know which one is the best for your child. 
You want something that is going to be healthy and fun, but you also don't want to spend a lot of 
time researching products. 
 
We have done the research for you! We have tested and reviewed all of the best bento boxes 
for kids, and we have found the perfect one for your child. This bento box is made out of durable 
plastic, has a divided tray, and comes in a variety of fun colors. 

Best Overall Bento Box For Kids 

 



Why We Love It? 

Bentgo Kids brings you everyone's favorite one-of-a-kind children’s lunchbox with fun prints and 
patterns that showcase your child’s personality. Thoughtfully designed and rigorously tested, 
parents love the 5 practical compartments portioned perfectly for a child’s appetite to encourage 
a healthy and balanced meal (recommended for ages 3-7). 
 
The Bentgo Kids Prints lunch box features leak-proof technology that keeps meals and snacks 
fresh and mess-free during transport. It is also designed with durable, rubber-coated edges that 
are slip and slide proof while meal prepping on the kitchen counter – making it ideal for active 
kids on the go. 
 
Plus, it’s all made with safe materials that are free of harmful chemicals. Order your Bentgo Kids 
lunch box today! 

What You Should Know 

When it comes to packed lunches, bento boxes are a great solution for picky eaters. That's 
because they allow you to divided up food into separate compartments, so your child can 
choose what they want to eat. 
 
And if you're worried about spillages, then don't be - these bento boxes are completely 
leakproof. They're also very easy to clean, which is always a bonus. Plus, kids have no 
problems opening and closing them. 
 
In fact, the only problem you might have is deciding which one to buy! There are loads of 
different designs on the market, but our personal favorite is the box with five compartments. 
That way, your child can enjoy a bit of everything. 

Best Leak-Proof Bento Box For Kids 

 



Why We Love It? 

Do you want to make sure your kids are getting a nutritious and delicious lunch every day? Well, 
Bentgo Kids Leak-Proof Bento-Style Kids Lunch Box is here to help you out! 
 
This bento box-style lunch box has five separate compartments, so you can add a variety of 
lunch items for the kiddo. Plus, the meals will stay hot and fresh until the school mealtime. And 
thanks to the leak-proof technology, you can even put juice boxes in the lunch box without 
worry. 
 
The lunch box also comes with two kid-friendly latches that are easy for small hands to open 
and close. Plus, it's easy to reheat and clean, so you can always have a healthy lunch on hand 
for your little one. 

What You Should Know? 

If you're looking for a bento box that will keep your child's lunch safe and sound, then you can't 
go wrong with the Bentgo Kids lunchbox. This box comes in a variety of colors, and it has five 
small food compartments that are perfect for snack time or a light meal. 
 
The best part about this lunch box is that it is made with durable rubber trim on the top and 
bottom which ensures that there are no leaks, no matter how active your child is. It also has a 
juvenile color scheme which is perfect for kids. 
 
Whether they're packing their lunch for school or bringing it along on a hike, the Bentgo Kids 
lunchbox is sure to hold everything in place. Thanks to its leak proof design, you can pack any 
type of food or snack without worry. And best of all, it's easy for kids to open and close, so they 
can independence when it's time to eat. So go ahead and put the spark back into packing with 
Bentgo Kids! 

Best Bento Box For Kids For Hot Food 

 



 

Why We Love It? 

Introducing the Bentgo Kids Leak-Proof, 5-Compartment Bento-Style Kids Lunch Box! Keep 
meals fresh and steamy hot with this lunch box. No matter how long lunch is kept in there, it will 
stay fresh like new. The best choice for a healthier, more delicious day for your little munchkin. 
 
Constructed with durable, rubber-coated edges that are slip and slide proof while meal prepping 
on the kitchen counter. This lunch box has a sturdy design and comes in attractive colors. The 
perfect way to keep your child's lunch fresh and tasty! 

What You Should Know? 

When it comes to packing lunch for your kids, you want to make sure they eat hot food that 
stays warm until they're ready to eat it. The best bento box for kids will keep their food hot for 
hours, so they can enjoy a hot meal even if they're on the go. 
 
Plus, the portion size is perfect for toddlers and young children. They can fill up on healthy fruits 
and vegetables, without being left feeling hungry afterwards. And because the bento box is 
divided into compartments, it's easy for kids to scoop out their food with a spoon - no need for a 
divided plate. 
 
The best thing is that the bento box comes with a 2 year warranty period, so you can rest 
assured knowing your investment is protected. 

Best Bento Box For Kids For Cold Meals 

 

Why We Love it? 

Introducing the Bentgo Kids Chill Lunch Box - with 4 Compartments and Removable Ice Pack! 
This lunch box is perfect for keeping your child's meals cool and fresh, whether they're at school 
or on the go. 



 
The removable ice pack ensures that food stays cool and fresh for longer, and the four 
compartments make it easy to pack a variety of snacks and meals. With its slim design, the 
lunch box is also easy to carry and fits easily into backpacks and bags. 
 
Plus, it comes with an industry-leading 2 Year Warranty, so you can be sure that your child's 
lunch will stay fresh and cool for years to come. 

What You Should Know? 

If you're looking for the best bento box for kids that will keep their meals cold, this is the one you 
want! It comes with a freezer pack, and the built in ice packs along with the extra ones keep it 
cool. 
 
The compartments are a great size and it is well-constructed. The lid has silicon padding which 
does a pretty good job sealing and mating with the interior "bento grid. 
 
Also, you can use the box with or without the freezer pack pretty successfully. Sometimes you 
want to keep everything cold, and sometimes you just have crackers / toast / carrot sticks and 
don't want it iced down. Either way, this is the best bento box for kids on the market! 

Best Bento Box For Kids For Age 2-3 

 

Why We Love It? 

Introducing the Munchkin Bento Box Toddler Lunch Box, Green! This is the best bento box for 
toddlers which is colorful, attractive, safe and durable. 
 



Recommended for kids above 18 months, the materials is BPA free hence very safe. The Bento 
box comes with 5 compartments letting you pack a balanced meal with ease. Plus, it includes 
stainless steel toddler utensils that snap directly to lid for easy storage. 
 
It's perfect for daycare, school lunches, or on-the-go! Comes with a kid-friendly design complete 
with a handle. You don't have to worry because it is a Dishwasher safe lunch box. Order yours 
today! 

What You Should Know? 

Packing a lunch box for your toddler can be a daunting task. You want to make sure they have a 
healthy and balanced meal, but you also don't want it to be a struggle to get them to eat it. 
 
The best bento box for toddlers is one that is safe and durable, with compartments that are 
perfect for small portions. Munchkin's Lunch Bento Box with Stainless Steel Utensils is a great 
option for toddlers. Plus, it comes in a variety of cute and trendy designs that your toddler is 
sure to love. 
 
It comes in attractive colors and is easy to clean. Plus, the stainless steel utensils are durable 
and safe for toddlers to use. So ditch the disposable baggies and plastic containers and make 
the switch to Munchkin's Lunch Bento Box - it's the best way to pack a healthy and stylish lunch 
for your toddler. 

Best Bento Boxes For Kids FAQ's 

It can be hard to know what the best bento box for kids is among the plethora of options. 
 
There are a lot of different bento boxes on the market, and it can be hard to know which one is 
right for your child. 
 
We've compiled a list of the most frequently asked questions about bento boxes for kids to help 
you decide which one is right for your kiddo. 

1. What kind of material is the best for bento box for kids? 

There are a few things to consider when choosing the best material for a bento box for kids. 
 
The first is durability - the box should be able to withstand being dropped or thrown without 
breaking. The second is insulation - the box should keep food cold or warm, depending on what 
type of food is being stored in it. And finally, the material should be easy to clean and non-toxic. 
 
Some materials that fit these criteria are stainless steel, silicone, plastic, and bamboo. Silicone 
is a good choice because it's durable, flexible, and non-toxic. It also has good insulation 
properties. Stainless steel is another good option because it's durable and easy to clean. 

2. Is bento box a healthy option? 



Yes, a bento box can be a healthy option, as long as you fill it with healthy foods. A bento box is 
typically a Japanese-style takeaway meal that consists of multiple small dishes or containers, 
each containing a different type of food. 
 
Some good options for bento box fillers include grilled chicken or fish, steamed vegetables, 
brown rice or quinoa, and salad. If you're looking for something sweet to finish off your meal, try 
packing some fresh fruit or berries instead of unhealthy snacks like potato chips or candy bars. 

3. How to choose a perfect lunch box for the kids? 

When choosing a perfect lunch box for your kids, it's important to consider a few key factors. 
One of the most important things is to make sure that the lunch box is easy to open and close. 
Kids can be fickle, and you don't want them to be hesitant to open their lunch box or put it away 
because it's difficult to use. 
 
Another thing to consider is size. You'll want to choose a lunch box that is big enough to fit all of 
your child's food, but not so big that it becomes cumbersome for them to carry around. And 
finally, you'll want to choose a style that your child will love. There are many different designs 
and colors available, so you're sure to find a perfect lunch box for your kid. 

4. Which bento box is best for cold food? 

Bentgo Kids Chill Lunch Box - with 4 Compartments and Removable Ice Pack is the best for 
cold food. This bento box is perfect for keeping cold food items separate and fresh. The built-in 
ice pack will help to keep your food chilled, while the four compartments make it easy to pack a 
variety of food groups. It is a great option for packing healthy lunches for your kiddo that need to 
be kept cold. 

5. Are plastic lunch boxes a good option? 

It depends on your own personal preferences and needs. That said, here are some things to 
consider when deciding whether to purchase plastic lunch boxes for kids. 
 
1) Plastic lunch boxes are generally less expensive than other options, such as stainless steel 
or glass. 
 
2) They are lightweight and easy to carry, making them ideal for on-the-go use. 
 
3) They can be easily cleaned in the dishwasher or with soap and water. 
 
4) Some people find that plastic lunch boxes keep food warm or cold for longer than other types 
of containers 

6. Which bento boxes are suitable for younger kids? 

There are a few things to consider when looking for bento boxes for younger kids for school 
lunch. One is size: the boxes should be small enough that your child can easily carry them 
around and also fit into a lunchbox or backpack. 



 
Another is durability: the boxes should be sturdy enough to withstand being thrown in a bag or 
dropped on the floor by younger children. And finally, it's important to find boxes for younger 
kids that are easy to clean, since kids can be notoriously messy eaters! 
 

7. Is stainless steel lunch box worth the investment? 

A stainless steel lunch box is definitely worth the investment if you're looking for something 
that's durable, healthy, and eco-friendly. A lot of people like to use a bento lunch box for 
younger children because it allows them to compartmentalize their food and make sure they're 
getting a balanced meal. 
 
The only downside to using a stainless steel bento lunch box is that it can be a bit difficult to 
clean if you don't have the right tools. Make sure you invest in some good dishwashing 
detergent and a stiff brush if you decide to go with this option! 

8. Which bento lunch boxes are good for hot or cold food? 

There are a few things to consider when looking for bento lunch boxes that are good for both 
hot and cold food. The most important factor is the material of the bento lunch boxes. 
 
If the material of the bento lunch boxes that can withstand both high and low temperatures, then 
it will be perfect for either hot or cold foods for school lunch. Otherwise, you will need to have 
two different lunch boxes - one for hot foods and one for cold food items. 
 
Another consideration is the size of the lunch box. If you plan to include both hot and cold items 
in your bento meal, the lunch box should be big enough to accommodate them all. And finally, 
make sure that the lid seals well so that your food stays fresh and doesn't go stale. 

9. Are bento boxes for kids dishwasher safe? 

Yes, most bento boxes are dishwasher safe. However, it is always best to check with the 
manufacturer to be sure. 
 
Bento boxes make packing a healthy lunch for kids easy and fun. They come in a variety of 
shapes and sizes, and can be made up of different compartments so that kids can have a little 
bit of everything. Bento boxes are also dishwasher safe, so cleaning them up is a breeze. 

10.  How much food can fit in a bento box for kids? 

A bento box for kids can hold a full packed lunch! It is a great way to give your child a well-
rounded, balanced meal. Bento boxes for kids typically come with several small compartments 
that can be used to store a variety of foods and keep the foods separate. 
 
Most bento boxes are dishwasher safe, so they're easy to clean. And because they come in a 
variety of colors and designs, they can also be quite decorative. 



11.  Does bento boxes for kids keep the food warm? 

Yes, Bento boxes for kids can keep the food warm hence the best option for school lunch. 
Bento boxes are a good way to pack a healthy lunch for kids because they are microwave and 
dishwasher safe. The divided compartments keep the foods separate, and the bento box will 
keep the food warm until lunchtime. 

12.  Is it okay to put box drinks in bento box? 

Yes, it is okay to put box drinks in bento boxes for school lunch. Bento boxes are designed in a 
way that they prevent leakage, so your drink will remain safe and contained within the box. 
Moreover, the compartments in the bento box keep the foods separate eliminating the risk of a 
mess. 

13.  Are bento boxes made of BPA free plastic? 

Yes, bento boxes are made of BPA free plastic. BPA free plastic is considered safe and 
durable. It is also eco-friendly, making it a good option for those looking for an environmentally 
friendly way to pack their lunch. Look for kids lunch boxes made of PP (polypropylene) or PET 
(polyethylene terephthalate) plastic, which are both free of BPA. 

Best Bento Box For Your Kid 

Bento boxes for kids are becoming increasingly popular and there is a good reason for it. They 
come in a variety of shapes and sizes, but the best ones have certain features in common. They 
should be durable, with a sturdy design that is easy to clean. Attractive colors are also a plus, as 
kids love them. And finally, the larger bento box has ample space for various food items which 
ensures a healthy balanced meal for the child. If you’re looking for the best bento box for your 
kid, tap the button to check out our top picks. 
We think your child will love it! 

Products 

Bentgo Kids Prints 5-Compartment Bento-Style Kids Lunch Box 

Bentgo Kids Leak-Proof, 5-Compartment Bento-Style Kids Lunch Box 

Bentgo Kids Brights 5-Compartment Bento-Style Kids Lunch Box 

Bentgo Kids Chill Lunch Box with 4 Compartments and Removable Ice 
Pack 

Munchkin Bento Box Toddler Lunch Box, Green 

 

https://www.amazon.com/Bentgo-Kids-Prints-Unicorn-5-Compartment/dp/B07QZ4CRP3/ref=sr_1_3?crid=2UF00JUD903UM&keywords=best%2Bbento%2Bbox%2Bfor%2Bkids&qid=1664790884&qu=eyJxc2MiOiI2LjE4IiwicXNhIjoiNS43NyIsInFzcCI6IjUuMDYifQ%3D%3D&refinements=p_72%3A1248915011&rnid=1248913011&s=home-garden&sprefix=best%2Bbento%2Bbox%2Bfor%2Bkids%2Caps%2C530&sr=1-3&th=1
https://www.amazon.com/Bentgo%C2%AE-Leak-Proof-5-Compartment-Bento-Style-Lunch/dp/B00PKNO7LK/ref=sr_1_2?crid=2UF00JUD903UM&keywords=best%2Bbento%2Bbox%2Bfor%2Bkids&qid=1664790884&qu=eyJxc2MiOiI2LjE4IiwicXNhIjoiNS43NyIsInFzcCI6IjUuMDYifQ%3D%3D&refinements=p_72%3A1248915011&rnid=1248913011&s=home-garden&sprefix=best%2Bbento%2Bbox%2Bfor%2Bkids%2Caps%2C530&sr=1-2&th=1
https://www.amazon.com/Bentgo-Kids-Brights-5-Compartment-Bento-Style/dp/B07DTLNZ5B/ref=sr_1_5?crid=2UF00JUD903UM&keywords=best%2Bbento%2Bbox%2Bfor%2Bkids&qid=1664790884&qu=eyJxc2MiOiI2LjE4IiwicXNhIjoiNS43NyIsInFzcCI6IjUuMDYifQ%3D%3D&refinements=p_72%3A1248915011&rnid=1248913011&s=home-garden&sprefix=best%2Bbento%2Bbox%2Bfor%2Bkids%2Caps%2C530&sr=1-5&th=1
https://www.amazon.com/Bentgo-Kids-Chill-Lunch-Box/dp/B08CVV7Z5H/ref=sr_1_1?crid=2UF00JUD903UM&keywords=best%2Bbento%2Bbox%2Bfor%2Bkids&qid=1664790884&qu=eyJxc2MiOiI2LjE4IiwicXNhIjoiNS43NyIsInFzcCI6IjUuMDYifQ%3D%3D&refinements=p_72%3A1248915011&rnid=1248913011&s=home-garden&sprefix=best%2Bbento%2Bbox%2Bfor%2Bkids%2Caps%2C530&sr=1-1&th=1
https://www.amazon.com/Bentgo-Kids-Chill-Lunch-Box/dp/B08CVV7Z5H/ref=sr_1_1?crid=2UF00JUD903UM&keywords=best%2Bbento%2Bbox%2Bfor%2Bkids&qid=1664790884&qu=eyJxc2MiOiI2LjE4IiwicXNhIjoiNS43NyIsInFzcCI6IjUuMDYifQ%3D%3D&refinements=p_72%3A1248915011&rnid=1248913011&s=home-garden&sprefix=best%2Bbento%2Bbox%2Bfor%2Bkids%2Caps%2C530&sr=1-1&th=1
https://www.amazon.com/Munchkin-Bento-Toddler-Lunch-Green/dp/B081FTXL87/ref=sr_1_4?crid=2UF00JUD903UM&keywords=best%2Bbento%2Bbox%2Bfor%2Bkids&qid=1664790884&qu=eyJxc2MiOiI2LjE4IiwicXNhIjoiNS43NyIsInFzcCI6IjUuMDYifQ%3D%3D&refinements=p_72%3A1248915011&rnid=1248913011&s=home-garden&sprefix=best%2Bbento%2Bbox%2Bfor%2Bkids%2Caps%2C530&sr=1-4&th=1

